SUPPLEMENT No. 2
TO
THE SOVEREIGN BASE AREAS GAZETTE
No. 408 of 26th June, 1975.
LEGISLATION

ORDINANCE 6 OF 1975.

AN ORDINANCE

To AMEND THE WATER SUPPLY
(Spucial Mrasures) ORDINANCE 1964.

R.D. ROE 9th Jure, 1875.
ACTING ADMINISTRATOR

BE it enacted by the Acting Administrator of the Sovereign
Base Areas of Akrotiri and Dhekelia as follows :(—

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Water Supply (Special
Measures) (Amendment) Ordinance, 1975 and shall be read as
one with the Water Supply (Special Measures) Ordinance, 1964
as amended by the Water Supply (Special Measures) (Amendment)
Ordinance, 1965 (hereinafter referred to as ‘the principal
Ordinance”).

2. Section 4 of the principal Ordinance is hereby amended—

(i) by inserting immediately after paragraph (a) of subsection
(1) thereof the following new paragraph te be lettered
(aa) :—

“(aa) pump, abstract, utilize or exploit underground
water save under the provisions of this Ordinance ;
or’;

(ii) by inserting immediately after paragraph (e) of subsection

(1) thereof the following new paragraph :—

“For the purposes of this subsection it shall be
presumed that any act or action, in respect of which
a permit under the provisions of this section is
required, was done or taken by the owner of the

(17)

Short title.

Ordinances
14/64 and 8/65.

Section 4 of
the principal
Ordinance
amended.



Section 5 of
the principal
Ordinance
amended.

Section 9 of
the principal
Ordinance
amended.

18

plot of land on which such act or action has taken
place, unless it is proved that such act or action
was done or taken without his knowledge.” ;

(iii) by substituting for the words “twenty-five pounds” in
the fifth line of sub-section (2) thereof the words “one
hundred pounds”.

3. Section 5 of the principal Ordinance is hereby amended
by substituting for the words ‘“twenty-five pounds” in the sixth
line of sub-section (6) thereof the words ‘“one hundred pounds”.

4. Section 9 of the principal Ordinance is hereby amended
by substituting for the words “twenty-five pounds” in the fourth
line of sub-section (3) thereof the words “one hundred pounds”.

AW. STEPHENS
9th June, 1975. Chief Officer.
(121/5)

Printed by the Sovereign Base Areas Administration Printing Press




